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Despite the fact that Cara Jablow was born with Down's syndrome, formerly known as 'mongolism', she was
reading before she was five. Her mother, a journalist, dramatically recounts Cara's development from birth to
age seven, revealing how a family reacts to the news that their baby is retarded, how they now can make use
of early intervention programs, and what Cara's prospects are for the future. The book is a personal success
story the author admits to a 'mother's pride' because Cara benefited from programs that gave her extensive
practice in motor and other skills. Not all the parents' dealings with doctors and educators have been good,
however. The Jablows frequently encountered stereotypes of how little potential Down's syndrome children
have, yet they also faced bureaucratic Catch-22s over Cara's developmental successes, as when Cara's speech
tested too close to age level for her to receive state-funded speech therapy. There is a great deal of family
dynamics here: how parents support each other in times of severe stress; how they break the news of a
retarded baby to friends and doting grandparents; and, how their normal children relate to the retarded one.
There are, of course, many special difficulties in raising a retarded child, but the book also points out that
raising a normal child isn't all that different. The many family photos vividly evoke this. Like other families,
the Jablows celebrate, suffer, and act silly. For professionals and parents, Cara's school life is illustrated with
photos, test results, and educators' comments on her development. Martha Moraghan Jablow is a freelance
journalist. She and Paul Jablow have two children, Cara and David, ages eight and six.
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From reader reviews:

Ila Petty:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means
that guide has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who
don't like studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Cara.

Alan Durham:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer may be Cara why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the
content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover.
Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Harriet Dupree:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can satisfy your
small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be study.
Cara can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.

Amanda Bernard:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
you is Cara this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This specific book
was represented how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer require to explain it is
easy to understand. The actual writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this
book appropriate all of you.
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