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This thrilling chapter book series will immediately suck readers in with its combination of fast-paced
adventure and full-color art!

When ten-year-old Tiger Brooks and his family move into a new home, he sees some strange things at the
house next door—like a talking pig in a top hat! When he and his neighbor, Luna Lopez, investigate, they
discover a reclusive old woman and her magical golden frame, through which they can enter the world's
greatest paintings. In this book, Tiger and Luna get pulled into the painting Surprised! or Tiger in a Tropical
Storm by Henri Rousseau. But they must escape the jungle adventure before time runs out, otherwise they'll
be trapped in the painting forever!

Praise for Danger! Tiger Crossing:

"Ten-year-old Tiger Brooks and his neighbor, Luna Lopez, get up-close and personal with Henri Rousseau’s
“Tiger in a Tropical Storm” in this action-driven first book in the Fantastic Frame series." –Publishers
Weekly

"Oliver keeps the plot itself snappy and peppy." -Kirkus
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From reader reviews:

Donovan Pena:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
As we know that book is very important for all of us. The book Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The Fantastic
Frame) has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The reserve Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The
Fantastic Frame) is not only giving you a lot more new information but also being your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship
together with the book Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The Fantastic Frame). You never feel lose out for
everything in case you read some books.

Mary Fleming:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Danger! Tiger Crossing #1
(The Fantastic Frame), you are able to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still wish to miss it?
What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't understand it, oh come
on its known as reading friends.

Douglas Holmes:

Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The Fantastic Frame) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy writer giving
his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The
Fantastic Frame) but doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm
resource details that maybe you can be among it. This great information can drawn you into new stage of
crucial imagining.

Patrica Fussell:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Danger! Tiger Crossing #1 (The Fantastic
Frame) can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your
extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?
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