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Persuasion is Jane Austen's last completed novel. She began it soon after she had finished Emma and
completed it in August 1816. She died, at age 41, in 1817;Persuasion was published in December of that year
(but dated 1818). Persuasion is linked to Northanger Abbey not only by the fact that the two books were
originally bound up in one volume and published together, but also because both stories are set partly in
Bath, a fashionable city with which Austen was well acquainted, having lived there from 1801 to 1805.

Besides the theme of persuasion, the novel evokes other topics, such as the Royal Navy, in which two of
Jane Austen's brothers ultimately rose to the rank of admiral. As in Northanger Abbey, the superficial social
life of Bath—well known to Austen, who spent several relatively unhappy and unproductive years there—is
portrayed extensively and serves as a setting for the second half of the book. In many respects, Persuasion
marks a break with Austen's previous works, both in the more biting, even irritable satire directed at some of
the novel's characters and in the regretful, resigned outlook of its otherwise admirable heroine, Anne Elliot,
in the first part of the story. Against this is set the energy and appeal of the Royal Navy, which symbolises
for Anne and the reader the possibility of a more outgoing, engaged, and fulfilling life, and it is this
worldview which triumphs for the most part at the end of the novel.
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From reader reviews:

Bobby Kile:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Persuasion. You can choose the best book if you
want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a new book Persuasion. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you can
know everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple
point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by
internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go
through.

Victoria Manson:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this Persuasion book as this book offers you
rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no
doubt in it you may already know.

Clifford Roselli:

Often the book Persuasion has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The
book was written by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior to write this book. This
particular book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this article book.

Ali Ellison:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information better to share.
You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for you
is Persuasion this e-book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. That book was
represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book ideal
all of you.
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